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Not applicable to CO #6. Resolved in later correspondence attached below. 
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Revised to updated date range in later correspondence attached below. 
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Costs, markup, etc. apportioned slightly differently than shown here.   See CO #6 Summary above for more detail. 
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Revised.   See later correspondence below for revised version.  







Brian Dellett
  

Senior Account Manager
  
5810 East 77th Avenue
Commerce City, CO 80022
  
Direct: 303-755-1281 | Cell: 303-324-1357
Email:  brian.dellett@gcinc.com

www.graniteconstruction.com
  

From: Dellett, Brian
To: Casey Hanson
Cc: Pat Eller; "levij@gillettewy.gov"
Subject: RE: GMPP Pump Testing Questions
Date: Thursday, April 30, 2020 10:58:50 AM
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***This message originated from an External Source.*** Please use proper judgment and
caution when opening attachments, clicking links, or responding to this email.

Casey, our reply is listed below in red.  I’ve attached supporting data where it has been
referenced below.  Please contact me if there are any additional clarifications required.
 

 

 
 
From: Casey Hanson <chanson@m-m.net> 
Sent: Friday, April 17, 2020 2:27 PM
To: Dellett, Brian <Brian.Dellett@gcinc.com>
Cc: Pat Eller <neller@m-m.net>; Levi Jensen <levij@gillettewy.gov>
Subject: GMPP Pump Testing Questions
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Granite
 
Brian,
 
We have reviewed your letter/proposal to finish the Contract 2A work on the GMPP – thank
you for providing that.  We have some questions and requests for information to complete

mailto:brian.dellett@layne.com
http://www.graniteconstruction.com/
https://www.facebook.com/graniteconstruction
https://www.linkedin.com/company/12601
https://www.twitter.com/Granite
https://www.instagram.com/graniteconstruction
mailto:Brian.Dellett@gcinc.com
mailto:chanson@m-m.net
mailto:neller@m-m.net
mailto:levij@gillettewy.gov
http://www.graniteconstruction.com/

















lgyne












_— .7[1;

1945 2020


























our review of the proposal. 
 
Questions:
 
1) Your letter states that the pricing for the new test pumping equipment does not include a
one year warranty.   What warranty coverage is provided in the event that the pumping
equipment fails during the test?  There would be a 1 year warranty on the new equipment. 
Please disregard this item from our April 3rd letter.  
2) It is understood that the attached pumping equipment list from Baker Hughes is
comprehensive of City equipment ownership at project completion, correct? Correct. Does
pricing include re-crating/wrapping equipment and delivery to City of Gillette warehouse? 
The cost for the crating has been added to the pumping equipment quote (copy attached). 
Layne would deliver this to a City of Gillette yard following the completion of this work. 
Layne would request a forklift at the storage facility from the City to facilitate off-loading.  
3) The Notice to Proceed date for this Contract was December 3, 2015, with a Substantial
Completion Date of March 27, 2017 and a Final Completion date of May 26, 2017. 
Contract times were adjusted via Change Orders 1-5, and contract prices for those items
were negotiated at the time of their execution.  Accordingly, the price escalation should only
be applied to the remaining work with the exception of purchasing the test pump, correct?  
Correct.  And shouldn’t the dates be from March 2017 through April 2020 for the PPI
escalation calculation? Agree.    We’ll need the flexibility to review this again prior to test
pumping operations/final completion, as the expected delivery of the test pumping
equipment is at the end of this year/beginning of next year and we anticipate a couple of
months to execute the final portion of the project after we receive the equipment.   
4)  Why is there a mobilization cost for the test pumping?   The mobilization effort for this
pump test is no different than the original scope of work and should have been included in
the contract mobilization price.  We were not allowed to complete the work under our
previous mobilization effort and have completely demobilized from the project site. 
5)  There have been discussions about the options of renting or purchasing the 10” pipe for
the pump test.   Please indicate which is being proposed here.  This is the purchase price
and the pipe would remain with the City after the work has been completed.  We would
move the pipe back to a City designated storage space. 
6)  It was noted that there is an additional service charge for two pump setups. (Three if you
include the one on the equipment list)  This work was included in the original contract work
as line item 2680.147 Install and Remove Test Pump Equipment for Final Pumping Tests,
as specified, Including Standby for Recovery After Pumping.   Please provide an
explanation for this cost - are you proposing the per each costs in lieu of this item, or in
addition to it?  In addition to it.  Is there a reason not to use the original bid item?  The
service provider for this changed during the time delay and the technician is now an
additional cost to us. 
 
Requests for Information  
 
1)  We could not duplicate the Producer Price Index numbers you reported.   Can you
please provide your source for this data? This data is in the attachment. Data was provided
by the US Department of Labor-Kansas City
2)  Please provide a quote or pricing data for 10” pipe handling tools, and estimated
slowdown by going to the larger pipe.  This data is in the attachment.  Based on our
previous oilfield equipment rental experience, we would expect to be charged for normal
wear after the rental.  Our intent is to be reimbursed on this item at cost + basis.  We are
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estimating an additional 10 hours for the install and 10 hours for the removal per well.  
3)  Are you planning on utilizing Bid Item 2680.146 Provide Test Pump Equipment,
Appurtenances, and Instrumentation for Final Pumping Test with a credit for the original
anticipated pump rental of $120,000?   Correct. If so, this leaves a cost of $330,000 for this
item across all three wells.  Some work that would have been included in this item
originally, such as the drop pipe and power cabling, is now being paid for under other
change order items.   Please provide explanation and justification of this cost under the
revised plan.  We already had the 8” drop pipe under the original test pumping plan.  The
cable was bundled with the rental testing pumping equipment that is no longer available
through our original service provider.   
  
Thanks,
 
Casey
 

Casey Hanson, PE
Director of Technical Services, Morrison-Maierle

 406.237.1241  direct   |  406.670.4254  mobile
 315 North 25th Street, Suite 102,  Billings, MT  59101
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Brian Dellett
  

Senior Account Manager
  
5810 East 77th Avenue
Commerce City, CO 80022
  
Direct: 303-755-1281 | Cell: 303-324-1357
Email:  brian.dellett@gcinc.com

www.graniteconstruction.com
  

From: Dellett, Brian
To: Pat Eller
Cc: Casey Hanson; Levi Jensen (LeviJ@gillettewy.gov)
Subject: Price Escalator
Date: Wednesday, May 20, 2020 8:17:21 AM
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***This message originated from an External Source.*** Please use proper judgment and
caution when opening attachments, clicking links, or responding to this email.

Pat,
 
Attached is recent data from the US Department of Labor for the Producer Price Index.  Layne
would propose the following:
 
117.1 (April 2020) – 112.1 (March 2017)/112.1 (March 2017) = .0446 rounded to .045
 
Layne would propose dividing the original contract pricing by .955 to arrive at the adjusted
price.  Layne is willing to keep this pricing through the balance of the contract.  As the
dynamics within the oil/gas industry are very fragile currently, Layne would request
expediting us getting back in the field to frac the last well.  There currently is a subcontractor
in Gillette capable of performing this work and we would like to proceed as soon as possible
so we do not lose our ability to perform this work with a local firm.  Please contact me with
any questions.   
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